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SKU: P301750

Availability: In Stock

Type: Cabinets, Sideboard Cabinets

Category: Living Room

Collection: Pulaski Accents

Style: Modern/Contemporary

Finish: Grays

Brand: PFC

Product Description: The 3-Door Metal Sideboard offers the perfect
blend of contemporary design and practical functionality. It features a
gray-colored metal cabinet and doors with a stacked pattern design on
the door fronts. A fixed shelf behind the doors provides additional
storage, allowing for better organization of items such as dishes,
glassware, or other household essentials. A contrasting light Mango
Wood top inset creates a pleasing contrast, softening the overall look
and making the sideboard more versatile for casual and modern
settings.

Collection Features: Elevate your space with our exquisite collection of
accents. Each piece is carefully curated to ensure it adds a unique
charm and character to your living area. Our pieces complement
various designs and blend seamlessly with any decor, enhancing the
overall ambiance and offering the perfect finishing touch to any room.

Status: Active

Finish: The sleek metal case and the warm, natural wood inset creates
a captivating contrast

Features: Blends natural and industrial elements for a dynamic and
versatile aesthetic
A stacked pattern design on the door fronts adds a unique visual
appeal
Three doors open to reveal ample storage with a single shelf behind
each door
A push-open mechanism is discreetly integrated for effortless door
opening

Material: Mango Wood

Frame Construction: Pulaski uses carefully chosen solid wood and
select wood veneers over durable wood products in our furniture
construction. Use of veneers enables more decorative looks
unattainable with solid wood. Veneers are used over durable wood
products such as medium density fiberboard (MDF) and particle board,
made of renewable resources. MDF and particle board are used in
quality furniture for areas that need to be stable, such as large surfaces.
These durable wood products do not expand and contract with heat
and cold and do not absorb moisture as much as solid wood, which
results in stronger and longer-lasting furniture.

Width: 59" (149.9 cm)



Depth: 18" (45.7 cm)

Height: 32" (81.3 cm)

Weight: 164.13 lb (73.9 kg)

Volume: 27.13 cu ft (0.8 m3)

Carton Width: 21 (53.3 cm)

Carton Height: 36 (91.4 cm)

Carton Weight: 189.49 lb (85.3 kg)

Carton Length: 62" (157.5 cm)


