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SKU: 9306024
Availability: In Stock

Type: Chests and Dressers, Chests
Category: Living Room

Collection: Easterbrook
Color: Dark Brown
Color

Family:
Brown

Width: 31.5" (80 cm)
Depth: 19" (48.3 cm)
Height: 30" (76.2 cm)
Weight: 86.2 lb (38.8 kg)
Volume: 12.3 cu ft (0.4 m3)

Carton
Width:

35 (88.9 cm)

Carton
Height:

27 (68.6 cm)

Carton
Length:

22.5" (57.2 cm)

Material: Wood
Style: Traditional/Formal

Country of
Origin:

Indonesia

Finish: Cherry
Brand: Butler Specialty Company

Product
Description:

Easterbrook 31.5 in. W Rectangular
Wood 4 Drawer Accent Chest in Dark
Brown

Long
Description:

This beautifully crafted Butler
Specialty Company 4-drawer accent
chest brings timeless elegance to any
room. Made from rich mahogany
wood and veneers, it showcases
classic turned legs and charming
rosette accents, giving it the look of a
cherished antique. Perfect for an
entryway, master suite, or living area,
this chest adds both style and
storage, enhancing your space with
its warm, traditional character. Its
refined details and graceful silhouette
make it a statement piece that
seamlessly blends function and
beauty.

EASTERBROOK ACCENT CHEST
9306024
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Shipping
Method:

LTL

Materials: Mahogany Wood, MDF, Plywood,
Resin, Mahogany Veneer, Bronze

Shape: Rectangular
Product

Features:
The color is medium to dark brown
Exceptionally built using Mahogany
Wood and Mahogany Veneers over
Engineered Wood with Bronze
Hardware
Construction Details: Thoughtfully
constructed from a solid mahogany
wood frame, complemented by MDF
and plywood for added stability.
Mahogany veneers lend a smooth,
rich finish, showcasing natural wood
grain variations that enhance the
chesta™s unique character. The four
spacious drawers glide smoothly on
metal slides and are accented with
bronze antique oval pull hardware,
providing both ease of use and an
elegant touch. Tudor Rose decorative
appliques and light paint distressing
add timeless charm, while a clear
lacquer coat protects the finish from
stains and scratches, ensuring lasting
beauty. The mortise and tenon
joinery, along with kiln-dried wood,
enhances the chest's structural
integrity, making it a durable choice
for any room. Ideal for both
residential and commercial settings,
this accent chest blends classic
design with practical durability.
Shape is rectangular with 4 legs
Product Dimensions: 31.5"W x 19"D
x 30"H, Item Weight: 70 lbs
Item requires partial assembly of legs
to base, no hardware or tools
necessary.
Complete your perfect look by mixing
and matching your decor with the
extensive range of products from
Butler Specialty Company! Discover
endless possibilities to express your
style and create a space that truly
feels like home.
2 Top Drawers Measure: 10.25"W x
16.25"D x 4.75"H; 2 Wide Bottom
Drawers Measure: 24.25"W x
16.25"D x 4.75"H
Leg Dimensions: 1.25 x 1.5 x 9.25
Gorgeous bronze oval pull hardware
inspired by European Hepplewhite
style.
Weight Capacity: 200 lbs
Ideal for use in living room, entryway,
office companion, bedroom or
game/recreation room. Great for
residential or commercial usage.
To clean, wipe clean with a clean dry
cloth and dust regularly. If spills
occur, wipe spills with a damp cloth
and dry immediately. No abrasives or



household cleaners which can
damage the wood. Drink coasters are
recommended

Shipping
Method:

LTL

Assembly: Needs Assembly


